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Exodus 38

Exodus 38:1-31 NKJV
He made the altar of burnt offering of acacia wood; five cubits was its 
length and five cubits its width—it was square—and its height was three 
cubits. He made its horns on its four corners; the horns were of one piece 
with it. And he overlaid it with bronze. He made all the utensils for the 
altar: the pans, the shovels, the basins, the forks, and the firepans; all its 
utensils he made of bronze. And he made a grate of bronze network for 
the altar, under its rim, midway from the bottom. He cast four rings for 
the four corners of the bronze grating, as holders for the poles. And he 
made the poles of acacia wood, and overlaid them with bronze. Then he 
put the poles into the rings on the sides of the altar, with which to bear it. 
He made the altar hollow with boards. He made the laver of bronze and 
its base of bronze, from the bronze mirrors of the serving women who 
assembled at the door of the tabernacle of meeting. Then he made the 
court on the south side; the hangings of the court were of fine woven 
linen, one hundred cubits long. There were twenty pillars for them, with 
twenty bronze sockets. The hooks of the pillars and their bands were 
silver. On the north side the hangings were one hundred cubits long, 
with twenty pillars and their twenty bronze sockets. The hooks of the 
pillars and their bands were silver. And on the west side there were 
hangings of fifty cubits, with ten pillars and their ten sockets. The hooks 
of the pillars and their bands were silver. For the east side the hangings 
were fifty cubits. The hangings of one side of the gate were fifteen 
cubits long, with their three pillars and their three sockets, and the same 
for the other side of the court gate; on this side and that were hangings of 
fifteen cubits, with their three pillars and their three sockets. All the 
hangings of the court all around were of fine woven linen. The sockets 
for the pillars were bronze, the hooks of the pillars and their bands were 
silver, and the overlay of their capitals was silver; and all the pillars of 
the court had bands of silver. The screen for the gate of the court was 
woven of blue, purple, and scarlet thread, and of fine woven linen. The 



length was twenty cubits, and the height along its width was five cubits, 
corresponding to the hangings of the court. And there were four pillars 
with their four sockets of bronze; their hooks were silver, and the 
overlay of their capitals and their bands was silver. All the pegs of the 
tabernacle, and of the court all around, were bronze. This is the 
inventory of the tabernacle, the tabernacle of the Testimony, which was 
counted according to the commandment of Moses, for the service of the 
Levites, by the hand of Ithamar, son of Aaron the priest. Bezalel the son 
of Uri, the son of Hur, of the tribe of Judah, made all that the LORD had 
commanded Moses. And with him was Aholiab the son of Ahisamach, 
of the tribe of Dan, an engraver and designer, a weaver of blue, purple, 
and scarlet thread, and of fine linen. All the gold that was used in all the 
work of the holy place, that is, the gold of the offering, was twenty-nine 
talents and seven hundred and thirty shekels, according to the shekel of 
the sanctuary. And the silver from those who were numbered of the 
congregation was one hundred talents and one thousand seven hundred 
and seventy-five shekels, according to the shekel of the sanctuary: a 
bekah for each man (that is, half a shekel, according to the shekel of the 
sanctuary), for everyone included in the numbering from twenty years 
old and above, for six hundred and three thousand, five hundred and 
fifty men. And from the hundred talents of silver were cast the sockets 
of the sanctuary and the bases of the veil: one hundred sockets from the 
hundred talents, one talent for each socket. Then from the one thousand 
seven hundred and seventy-five shekels he made hooks for the pillars, 
overlaid their capitals, and made bands for them. The offering of bronze 
was seventy talents and two thousand four hundred shekels. And with it 
he made the sockets for the door of the tabernacle of meeting, the bronze 
altar, the bronze grating for it, and all the utensils for the altar, the 
sockets for the court all around, the bases for the court gate, all the pegs 
for the tabernacle, and all the pegs for the court all around. 

Daily Deep Dive:
The UCG reading plan for this chapter states: “Chapter 38 concerns the 
court of the tabernacle. It begins with the construction of the altar of 



burnt offering, according to God's instructions in Exodus 27:1-8. Then 
follows the bronze laver or washbasin, according to God's instructions 
from Exodus 30:17-21. Finally, we see the construction of the court 
itself, following what God told Moses in Exodus 27:9-19. Notice that the 
various furnishings, including those inside the sanctuary, were made 
with rings to slide poles through for carrying. This was to keep people 
from touching the holy implements. God's perfection and glory were 
symbolized by these items, and thus they were not to be profaned.
The chapter ends with a summary of the precious metals that went into 
the building of the construction of the tabernacle and its furnishings. As 
a talent weighed about 70 pounds, equaling 3,000 shekels, the weight of 
all the gold used may have been around a ton. The weight of the bronze 
was around 2 1/2 tons. And the silver added up to the enormous weight 
of 3 1/2 tons! Indeed, silver was used in even the most basic elements of 
the tabernacle and its accoutrements. As The Nelson Study Bible notes: 
"Although the tabernacle was a tent, it was not a makeshift dwelling. It 
was a glorious shrine that symbolized the presence of the living God in 
the midst of His people." Lest we think these are unimportant or 
insignificant details, Hebrews 8:5 and Hebrews 9:23 remind us that the 
tabernacle and its furnishings were "the copy and shadow of the 
heavenly things" and "copies of the things in the heavens." [END]
Here is a video for the Court of the Tabernacle:
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=8d_x5br8Zqc
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